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2025 MATERIAL BID SUMMARY

CADIZ FREEPORT
Winter Additive | Unleaded #2 Diesel Unleaded #2 Diesel
RJ Wright & Sons LTD 0.0200 0.0450 0.0450 0.0450 0.0450
Petroleum Traders Corp 0.0350 0.0286 0.0325 No Bid 0.0325
Riley Petroleum 0.02 0.09 0.09 0.09 0.09
FOB Plant FOB Harrison Cty.
RS2 $2.300 $2.445
HFRS 2 $2.300 $2.445
MWS 90 Sealing $2.300 $2.445
MWS 150 SS $2.400 $2.545
AEDP Solventless Primer $1.800 $1.945
Fog Seal $1.750 $1.895
POLY HFRS-2 $2.650 $2.795
Permacoat 250 $3.800 $3.945
Pugging Fee $4.000
Immobilization (Flat Rate Fee) $1,500.00
301 402 404 441S 441 |
Newton Asphalt - Dover $73.00| $75.00 $80.00
NLS Paving, Inc $79.00| No Bid No Bid| $86.50 $80.00
Mar-Zane, Inc - Gnadenhutten $72.00| $75.00 $80.00 $80.00 $75.00
#57 #67 Rip Rap Rip Rap
#8 Western Western Western Limestone Sandrock Sandrock #310
#1 or #2 #4 #8 White #57 White #67 White #304 #411 #617 #467 AB,CorD AB,CorD Type0-2 Gabion Fines
National Lime & Stone Tusk_y Plant $32.90 $32.90 No Bid $32.90 No Bid $32.90 No B?d $33.95 $32.90 $32.90 No Bid No Bid $41.85 No BFd No BFd No Bid No Bid
Cadiz Plant $32.15 $32.15 No Bid $32.15 No Bid $32.15 No Bid $33.20 | $32.15 | $32.15 | NoBid | NoBid $41.85 No Bid NoBid [NoBid  |No Bid
Kimble Company ) . . $38.50 (A-C) . .
Dover Plant $24.75 $24.75 $23.50 $30.75 $27.00 $28.00 |No Bid $30.75 $23.50 $23.50 No Bid No Bid $32.75 (D) $37.00 $8.50 No Bid no Bid
Sidwell Materials Uniontown Stone| $14.20 $14.20 $14.45 No Bid $18.60 No Bid $18.60 No Bid $14.20 No Bid $14.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.75 $5.30
L & J Bowers Inc FOB Cadiz $45.50 No Bid $50.25 No Bid $45.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00 | NoBid | $42.00 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
#8 #57 #304 Sand  Concrete Sand Grit Sand Fill Sand
Sidwell Materials/Midvale $14.55 $30.30 No Bid No Bid $6.65 No Bid $6.05
Ice
Control
GritSand  #9 Grits
Sidwell Materials/Midvale $5.85 | $10.65 |




